
BID TABULATION 
2024 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening March 20, 2024

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

Morgan Pavement Maintenance Staker & Parson Companies
Advanced Paving &

Construction
Asphalt Preservation

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “A” - SLURRY SEAL TYPE II

A1
Furnish and Install Slurry Seal Type
II - Public Roads

1,450,000 SF $0.1673 $242,585.00

No Bid No Bid

$0.1740 $252,300.00

A2 Veterans Park Parking Lot 20,100 SF $0.1673 $3,362.73 $0.1740 $3,497.40
A3 Dow James Park Parking Lot 44,200 SF $0.1673 $7,394.66 $0.1740 $7,690.80
A4 Settler’s Park Parking Lot 5,400 SF $0.1673 $903.42 $0.1740 $939.60
A5 Copper Canyon Park Parking Lot 14,500 SF $0.1673 $2,425.85 $0.1740 $2,523.00
A6 Pavement Striping 1 LS $1,732.78 $1,732.78 $3,650.00 $3,650.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A” $258,404.44 $270,600.80

Comments

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

B1
Furnish and Install Light Weight
Aggregate Chip Seal

725,000 SF $0.43 $311,750.00 $0.45 $326,250.00 $0.35 $253,750.00

No Bid

B2
Furnish and Install 4" Double Solid
Yellow Line

950 LF $5.50 $5,225.00 $5.50 $5,225.00 $1.00 $950.00

B3
Furnish and Install 4" Single Solid
White Line

325 LF $2.75 $893.75 $2.75 $893.75 $1.00 $325.00

B4
Furnish and Install Stop Bar
Pavement Marking

5 EA $94.50 $472.50 $93.15 $465.75 $45.00 $225.00

B5
Furnish and Install Cross Walk
Pavement Marking

7 EA $400.00 $2,800.00 $399.00 $2,793.00 $465.00 $3,255.00

B6
Furnish and Install Turn Arrows
Pavement Marking

2 EA $94.50 $189.00 $93.15 $186.30 $77.00 $154.00

B7
Furnish and Install School
Pavement Marking

10 EA $110.00 $1,100.00 $110.00 $1,100.00 $95.00 $950.00

B8

Furnish and Install Single White
Boundary and Diagonal Stripes in
No Parking Zones Adjacent to
Sterling Elementary School

1 LS $1,375.00 $1,375.00 $1,375.00 $1,375.00 $825.00 $825.00

B9

Furnish and Install Double Yellow
Boundary and Diagonal Stripes in
Center Painted Island Adjacent to
Sterling Elementary School

1 LS $1,375.00 $1,375.00 $1,375.00 $1,375.00 $930.00 $930.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “B” $325,180.25 $339,663.80 $261,364.00

Comments 
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BID TABULATION 
2024 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening March 20, 2024

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

Morgan Pavement Maintenance Staker & Parson Companies
Advanced Paving &

Construction
Asphalt Preservation

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL AND ASPHALT OVERLAY

C1
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall 
Concrete Collars Around Wate

2 EA

No Bid No Bid

$1,300.00 $2,600.00

No Bid

C2
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
Concrete Collars Around Manhole

4 EA $1,350.00 $5,400.00

C3
Roto-Mill Edge of Existing
Roadways (taper 2" below lip of

1,275 LF $6.40 $8,160.00

C4 Furnish and Install Level Course 200 TON $115.00 $23,000.00

C5
Furnish and Install 2 ½” PG 64-28
Asphalt

19,500 SF $2.00 $39,000.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “C” $78,160.00

Comments 
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BID TABULATION 
2024 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening March 20, 2024

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

American Pavement
Preservation

Consolidated Paving & 
Concrete

M&M Asphalt Services

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “A” - SLURRY SEAL TYPE II

A1
Furnish and Install Slurry Seal Type
II - Public Roads

1,450,000 SF $0.1970 $285,650.00

No Bid

$0.1800 $261,000.00

A2 Veterans Park Parking Lot 20,100 SF $0.2450 $4,924.50 $0.1800 $3,618.00
A3 Dow James Park Parking Lot 44,200 SF $0.2200 $9,724.00 $0.1800 $7,956.00
A4 Settler’s Park Parking Lot 5,400 SF $0.0350 $189.00 $0.1800 $972.00
A5 Copper Canyon Park Parking Lot 14,500 SF $0.0250 $362.50 $0.1800 $2,610.00
A6 Pavement Striping 1 LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “A” $305,850.00 $279,156.00

Comments
Bid Adjusted in favor of Unit

Prices

 BID SCHEDULE “B” - LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE CHIP SEAL

B1
Furnish and Install Light Weight
Aggregate Chip Seal

725,000 SF

No Bid

$0.41 $297,250.00

No Bid

B2
Furnish and Install 4" Double Solid
Yellow Line

950 LF $0.92 $874.00

B3
Furnish and Install 4" Single Solid
White Line

325 LF $0.92 $299.00

B4
Furnish and Install Stop Bar
Pavement Marking

5 EA $73.20 $366.00

B5
Furnish and Install Cross Walk
Pavement Marking

7 EA $146.40 $1,024.80

B6
Furnish and Install Turn Arrows
Pavement Marking

2 EA $91.50 $183.00

B7
Furnish and Install School
Pavement Marking

10 EA $183.00 $1,830.00

B8

Furnish and Install Single White
Boundary and Diagonal Stripes in
No Parking Zones Adjacent to
Sterling Elementary School

1 LS $793.00 $793.00

B9

Furnish and Install Double Yellow
Boundary and Diagonal Stripes in
Center Painted Island Adjacent to
Sterling Elementary School

1 LS $915.00 $915.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “B” $303,534.80

Comments 
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BID TABULATION 
2024 Roadway Maintenance Project

Bid Opening March 20, 2024

Item
No.

Description
Bid 

Quantity
Unit

American Pavement
Preservation

Consolidated Paving & 
Concrete

M&M Asphalt Services

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 BID SCHEDULE “C” - ROTO-MILL AND ASPHALT OVERLAY

C1
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall 
Concrete Collars Around Wate

2 EA

No Bid

$1,159.00 $2,318.00

No Bid

C2
Remove, Adjust and Reinstall
Concrete Collars Around Manhole

4 EA $1,525.00 $6,100.00

C3
Roto-Mill Edge of Existing
Roadways (taper 2" below lip of

1,275 LF $16.26 $20,731.50

C4 Furnish and Install Level Course 200 TON $173.65 $34,730.00

C5
Furnish and Install 2 ½” PG 64-28
Asphalt

19,500 SF $2.41 $46,995.00

SUB TOTAL - BID SCHEDULE “C” $110,874.50

Comments 
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